
 

FRANCESCO MORO JOINS NEW DEAL ADVISORS TO 

LEAD DEBT & RESTRUCTURING ADVISORY 

Milan, December 05, 2022 – New Deal Advisors, an independent company specialising in 
advisory services to M&A Transactions, announces the appointment of Francesco Moro, 
who will assume the leadership of the new business unit Debt & Restructuring Advisory. 

Francesco has more than 20 years of experience in the financial sector (Intesa Sanpaolo, 
Lazard, illimity), with experience gained in advisory, banking and investment management. 
In particular, Francesco specializes redefining the debt and capital structure of clients. 
Thanks to his experience, he has developed an in-depth knowledge of di!erent realities: 
corporates, private equity and turnaround funds. 

"The opening of the Restructuring practice represents a further growth opportunity for 
New Deal Advisors, which aspires to o!er increasingly full-service support to its clients. 
Through comprehensive and pragmatic consulting, ranging from Due Diligence to 
Transaction, from Restructuring to Transformation, as well as o!ering support in Forensic 
& Legal, the new business unit represents an important added value." comments Mara 
Caverni, Managing Partner of New Deal Advisors. 

"In a di"cult economic environment where insolvency rate forecasts are increasing, it will 
be crucial to provide support to companies in financial distress to facilitate a rapid and 
sustainable recovery." adds Francesco Moro, Head of Debt & Restructuring Advisory at 
New Deal Advisors. 

*** 



New Deal Advisors is an independent firm specialising in advisory services in M&A. 
Established in 2012, New Deal Advisors provides support in a broad variety of 
extraordinary transactions streams including mergers and acquisitions, restructuring, 
transformation  
processes, forensic and litigation activities, fairness opinions and valuation services. New 
Deal Advisors has worked for more than a decade alongside private equity funds, 
investment holdings, family o"ces, financial institutions and strategic players achieving to 
date the finalisation of over 200 deals. 


